
Purchasing Memo 
To: Finance & Operations Committee Members 
From: Jason Gillam, Director of Business Operations 

Jake Slobodnik, Chief Operations Officer 
Date: March 5, 2026 
Re: Bids and Purchases 

DESIGN & CONSTRUCTION PURCHASES 

MLT-2603 STAN & OTE Flooring Replacements $179,655.00 Estimated 
Vendor: Regents Flooring 
Cooperative: Sourcewell #080819-MMI 
Location: STAN, OTE 
Anticipated Funding: Bond 
Page 4 

Emergency Purchase – BVN Volleyball Standards $52,600.00 
Vendor: Spoonball Sports LLC 
Location: BVN 
Anticipated Funding: Capital Outlay 
Page 6 

BIDS 

26026 WSM Kitchen supplies $48,372.10 
Vendor: Index Restaurant Supply 
Location: WSM 
Anticipated Funding: Bond 
Page 7 

26027 Copy Paper $53,592.00 Estimated 
Vendors: Performance Office Papers 
Location: Logistics Center 
Anticipated Funding: General Fund 
Page 12 

26028 BVN Double Stack Oven $21,900.00 
Vendor: Index Restaurant Supply  
Location: BVN 
Anticipated Funding: Capital Outlay 
Page 14 

26030 Musical Instruments -Orchestra $21,175.07 
Vendors: Meyer Music Company $7,259.70 
KC Strings Inc $1,312.00 
Palen Music Center Inc $2,800.00 
Shar Products $9,803.37 
Location: District Wide 
Anticipated Funding: Capital Outlay 
Page 16 

1



26031 Musical Instruments -Band $166,045.07 Estimated 
Vendors: Music And Arts/Guitar Center    $645.19 
Steve Weiss Music Inc                             $15,576.00 
Washington Music Sales Inc                    $43,725.80 
Meyer Music Company                             $390.50 
Sweetwater Sound LLC $102,887.48 
Palen Music Center Inc $2,820.10  
Location: District Wide 
Anticipated Funding: Capital Outlay 
Page 19 
 

COOPERATIVE PURCHASES 
 
CDW Government Inc  $70,000.00 Estimated 
This is the annual renewal of Adobe Creative Cloud software used in various instructional labs and student/staff devices. 
26-064. 
Cooperative: Greenbush # 022-G 
Anticipated Funding: Capital Outlay 
Page 23 
 
CDW Government Inc  $385,476.00 Estimated 
This purchase will refresh the F5 hardware and software for five years. The F5 platform provides DNS, load balancing, 
SSL offloading, and other vital functions within the organization. 26-061 
Cooperative: Greenbush # 022-G 
Anticipated Funding: Bond 
Page 26 
 
CDW Government Inc  $101,270.25 Estimated 
This 3-year software purchase will continue the BV Security Awareness program for the district employees. 26-060 
Cooperative: Greenbush # 022-G 
Anticipated Funding: Bond 
Page 29 
 
Dell Computer Corp  $411,397.80 Estimated 
This purchase will refresh the current Middle School Pre-engineering lab devices. 26-062 
Cooperative: NASPO C000001119033 / State of Kansas 55221 
Anticipated Funding: Bond 
Page 32 
 
Helm Service  $32,429.00 Estimated 
This purchase is to provide labor and materials as needed to replace the compressor #2 in Chiller #2 at Cedar Hills 
Elementary.  
Cooperative: TIPS #25010502 
Anticipated Funding: Capital Outlay 
Page 38 
 
McConnell & Associates Corp  $61,874.00  
This purchase is to resurface the BVN Tennis Courts to eliminate significant dead spots in the playing surface.  
Cooperative: TIPS #23020101 
Anticipated Funding: Capital Outlay 
Page 43 
 
 
SERVICE PURCHASES 
 
AVID Center  2025/2026 2026/2027 
 $26,545.00  $27,300.00 Estimated 
AVID membership renewal and AVID weekly secondary, per school for BVH, BVN, BVNW, BVSW and BVW. 
Funds: General Fund 
Page 50 
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The Brighthouse Academy LLC  2024/2025 2025/2026 
 N/A  $62,000.00 Estimated 
Student (OM) will be attending Brighthouse Academy for hourly transition services (up to 10 hours/week) for the 
remainder of the 25-26 school year. This is an IEP decision. 
Funds: Special Education 
Page 55 
 
Morris Leatherman Company  2024/2025 2025/2026 
 N/A  $37,700.00 Estimated 
As part of the future Bond planning efforts, this contract would support a community-wide survey related to a 
potential Bond referendum. 
Funds: Bond 
Page 58 
 
ParentSquare Inc  2024/2025 2025/2026 – 2028/2029 
 N/A  $288,820.00 Estimated 
ParentSquare is a unified communication platform that will streamline communications between staff, students, 
and families. This is a 3 yr contract paid annually. 26-063. 
One-time fees: $   8,100 (implementation & onboarding) 
1st yr.               $ 89,100 
2nd yr.              $ 93,500 
3rd yr.               $ 98,120 
Funds: Capital Outlay 
Page 64 
 
Summit Behavioral Services  2024/2025 2025/2026 
 N/A  $50,000.00 Estimated 
A student (NV) will receive services from Summit Achievement Center until they are able to return to a Blue Valley 
classroom.  This is an IEP decision.  Summit Achievement Center will implement programming for the student. 
Funds: Special Education 
Page 72 
 
University of Kansas Center for Research Inc 2024/2025 2025/2026 
 N/A  $36,132.00 Estimated 
The SWIFT Education Center (part of the University of Kansas Center for Research) will combine on-site and 
virtual consultation services to support the district with the implementation of a Multi-Tiered System of Support 
(MTSS) in Blue Valley. This consultation will provide an emphasis at the elementary level on behavior supports. 
Funds: General Fund 
Page 79 
 
 
 
 

3



BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateJake Slobodnik
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateJake Slobodnik
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$ 53,592.00 Estimated
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26028 - BVN Double Stack Ovens

Line 
Item

Description Manufacturer Model No. Quantity Units Unit Price Extended Price
Vendor Part 
No.

Unit Price Extended Price Vendor Part No. Unit Price
Extended 
Price

Vendor Part No.
Additional 
Information

Unit Price
Extended 
Price

Vendor Part 
No.

Additional 
Information

1

Blodgett Double Stack Ovens for Blue Valley 
North
Price Includes: Freight Paid Delivered 
Uncrated Set in Place Ready for Final Hook-
Up by Vendor 

Refer to bid document for product 
specifications

Blodgett ZEPH-100-G DBL 2 Each $ 10,950.00 $21,900.00
ZEPH-100-G 
DBL

$ 11,350.00 $22,700.00 ZEPH-100-G DBL $ 11,528.50 $23,057.00 Zeph-100-G- DBL $ 11,869.00 $23,738.00
ZEPH-11-D-
DBL

2 Removal of Old Equipment Blodgett DFG100-3-S 2 Each $ 0.00 $0.00 Remove $ 1.00 $2.00 B&J $ 0.00 $0.00 .
Included in Oven 
Pricing

$ 0.00 $0.00 NA
Included in 
prices above

3 Credit for Old Equipment Blodgett DFG100-3-S 2 Each $ 0.00 $0.00 Credit $ 1.00 $2.00 B&J $ 0.00 $0.00 .
Included In Oven 
Pricing

$ 0.00 $0.00 NA

Totals: $21,900.00 $22,704.00 $23,057.00 $23,738.00

Line 
Item

Description Manufacturer Model No. Quantity Units Unit Price Extended Price
Vendor Part 
No.

Additional 
Information

Unit Price Extended Price
Vendor Part 
No.

Unit Price Extended Price Vendor Part No. Unit Price
Extended 
Price

Vendor Part 
No.

Unit Price
Extended 
Price

Vendor Part 
No.

1

Blodgett Double Stack Ovens for Blue Valley 
North
Price Includes: Freight Paid Delivered 
Uncrated Set in Place Ready for Final Hook-
Up by Vendor 

Refer to bid document for product 
specifications

Blodgett ZEPH-100-G DBL 2 Each $ 12,470.12 $24,940.24
ZEPH-100-

na $ 11,495.56 $22,991.12
ZEPH-100-G 
DBL

$ 12,438.50 $24,877.00
Blogett
ZEPH-100-G DBL

$ 11,861.85 $23,723.70
ZEPH-100-G 
DBL

$ 13,800.00 $27,600.00
ZEPH-100-

2 Removal of Old Equipment Blodgett DFG100-3-S 2 Each $ 0.00 $0.00 Install 

Installation 
and removal 
is one price 
included in 
above

$ 1,040.00 $2,080.00 N/A $ 1,169.44 $2,338.88 CSI Inc. $ 1.00 $2.00 Removal $ 200.00 $400.00 N/A

3 Credit for Old Equipment Blodgett DFG100-3-S 2 Each $ 0.00 $0.00 na $ 0.00 $0.00 N/A $ 0.00 $0.00 N/A $ 1,800.00 $3,600.00 Install $ 0.00 $0.00 N/A
Totals: $24,940.24 $25,071.12 $27,215.88 $27,325.70 $28,000.00

Pueblo Hotel Supply Chefs Depot 11400 Inc. Douglas Food Stores Inc

Index Restaurant Supply B & J Foodservice Equipment Sunflower Restaurant Supply Trimark/Hockenbergs

The Boelter Companies, Inc
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26030 - Orchestra Musical Instruments

Line 
Item Manufacturer Model No. Specification Quantitiy Unit Price Extended Price Offering

Vendor Part 
No. Unit Price

Extended 
Price Offering

Alternate Offer 
Description

Vendor Part 
No. Unit Price

Extended 
Price Offering Alternate Offer Description

1 High Quality Intermediate 
Instrument

Krutz 300  or equal

4/4 cello Seasoned spruce top; 
Seasoned maple back ribs and 
scroll; Moderately high flame; 
inlaid purfling; Shaded oil varnish; 
Ebony fittings; D'Addario Kaplan 
strings; composite tailpiece w/4 
fine tuners; steel endpin 
w/screwed rubber stopper. Bridge 
pegs fingerboard nut and 
soundpost assembled dressed 
fitted and tonally adjusted

1 $ 0.0000 $0.00 No Bid C430 E410 $ 1,312.00 $1,312.00 As specified Includes bag (no 
bow)

MLS510C-M $ 1,662.720 $1,662.72 As specified

Maple Leaf Strings Parisian Eye fittings 
with Wittner single fine tuner Aubert 14 
bridge and 21.5" Carbon Fiber Rod Endpin 
with a Composite Plug

• D'Addario Helicore strings

• Professional quality hand-applied spirit 
and oil mixed varnish shaded with a 
defined edge color pattern and light 
antiquing

2 CodaBow Diamond NX or equal Carbon Fiber Bow 3 $ 379.5000 $1,138.50 As specified No Bid No Bid

3 BAM 1001SW  or equal Class cello case with wheels black 5 $ 0.0000 $0.00 No Bid No Bid CC3100 $ 210.000 $1,050.00 Alternate Offer
Maple leaf strings cello case with wheels 
black with zipper.

4 Bobelock B4-1020-2-BK  or equal

3/4 Double Bass Cover with 1" 
Foam Padding and Durable Nylon 
Exterior Zipping Storage Pouches 
Shoulder Straps Black

1 $ 0.0000 $0.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

5 Advanced Instrument
Giuseppe SE47MM or 
equal

4/4 Cello Outfit  Beautifully flamed 
hand applied oil varnish. Expertly 
applied varnish in an antique finish 
Aged tone woods includes Soft 
Case and 4/4 CODA DIAMOND GX 
BOW

2 $ 2,061.1500 $4,122.30 As specified No Bid MLS513C $ 1,400.000 $2,800.00 Alternate Offer

 Maple Leaf Strings: Professional quality 
hand-applied spirit and oil mixed varnish 
shaded with a defined edge color pattern
• Fully hand-carved seasoned spruce top 
and flamed curly European maple back 
that have been dried for 4-5 years
• Aubert 14 bridge
-Braided Carbon fiber Bow
-soft case

6 Intermediate  Instrument
Giuseppe SBBA18MM or 
equal

3/4 Double Bass Outfit carved 
wood ebony fingerboard machine 
tuners 

1 $ 1,928.8500 $1,928.85 As specified B330 P310 $ 2,307.00 $2,307.00 Alternate Offer
Krutz 300 Series bass - 
Includes bag (no 
bow)

MLS140B $ 2,705.120 $2,705.12 Alternate Offer

Maple Leaf Strings: • Ebony tailpiece with 
high grade bridge and 4 piece French style 
brass machine heads and an 18.5" Steel 
Rod Endpin with a Graphite Composite 
Plug

7 Intermediate  Instrument
Giuseppe SBCEK500C or 
equal

4/4 Cello Outfit carved wood 
ebony fingerboard

1 $ 1,928.8500 $1,928.85 As specified C430 E410 $ 1,312.00 $1,312.00 Alternate Offer
Krutz 300 Series cello - 
Includes bag (no 
bow)

MLS510C-M $ 1,699.000 $1,699.00 Alternate Offer

Maple Leaf Strings: • Parisian Eye fittings 
with Wittner single fine tuner Aubert 14 
bridge and 21.5" Carbon Fiber Rod Endpin 
with a Composite Plug

• D'Addario Helicore strings

8 Protec C310E or equal 4/4 Cello Bag 8 $ 0.0000 $0.00 No Bid No Bid CC100144 $ 60.000 $480.00 Alternate Offer

Maple Leaf strings The Student Bag No. 
1001 is included with all cello models 110-
140; also available for individual sale. Its 
padded cushion fabric provides a 
lightweight yet protective design. Two 
zippers provide a secure fit to offer your 
instrument reliable protection for storage 

9 Protec C309E or equal 3/4 Cello Bag 4 $ 0.0000 $0.00 No Bid No Bid CC100134 $ 60.000 $240.00 Alternate Offer

Maple Leaf Strings The Student Bag No. 
1001 is included with all cello models 110-
140; also available for individual sale. Its 
padded cushion fabric provides a 
lightweight yet protective design. Two 
zippers provide a secure fit to offer your 
instrument reliable protection for storage 

10 Professional Grade
Giuseppe LE38MM or 
equal

3/4 Cello Modestly flamed 
traditional finished with hand 
applied spirit varnish Aged tone 
woods 
* Includes soft case and CODA 
PRODIGY 3/4 BOW

2 $ 1,400.7000 $2,801.40 As specified No Bid No Bid

11 CodaBow Prodigy or Equal 3/4 Cello Bow 2 $ 300.3000 $600.60 As specified No Bid BCCFB34 $ 90.000 $180.00 Alternate Offer

Maple Leaf Strings The woven carbon fiber 
stick design is as beautiful as it is 
responsive.

The metal tip provides durability in high 
impact environments as well as improving 
balance and playability.

12 CodaBow Revalation or equal French Bass Bow  3 $ 524.7000 $1,574.10 As specified No Bid BBCFBF $ 175.000 $525.00 Alternate Offer

Maple Leaf Strings The woven carbon fiber 
stick design is as beautiful as it is 
responsive.

The metal tip provides durability in high 
impact environments as well as improving 
balance and playability.

Award Totals: $21,175.07 $7,259.70 $1,312.00 $2,800.00

KC Strings INC Palen Music
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26030 - Orchestra Musical Instruments

Line 
Item Manufacturer Model No. Specification Quantitiy

1 High Quality Intermediate 
Instrument

Krutz 300  or equal

4/4 cello Seasoned spruce top; 
Seasoned maple back ribs and 
scroll; Moderately high flame; 
inlaid purfling; Shaded oil varnish; 
Ebony fittings; D'Addario Kaplan 
strings; composite tailpiece w/4 
fine tuners; steel endpin 
w/screwed rubber stopper. Bridge 
pegs fingerboard nut and 
soundpost assembled dressed 
fitted and tonally adjusted

1

2 CodaBow Diamond NX or equal Carbon Fiber Bow 3

3 BAM 1001SW  or equal Class cello case with wheels black 5

4 Bobelock B4-1020-2-BK  or equal

3/4 Double Bass Cover with 1" 
Foam Padding and Durable Nylon 
Exterior Zipping Storage Pouches 
Shoulder Straps Black

1

5 Advanced Instrument
Giuseppe SE47MM or 
equal

4/4 Cello Outfit  Beautifully flamed 
hand applied oil varnish. Expertly 
applied varnish in an antique finish 
Aged tone woods includes Soft 
Case and 4/4 CODA DIAMOND GX 
BOW

2

6 Intermediate  Instrument
Giuseppe SBBA18MM or 
equal

3/4 Double Bass Outfit carved 
wood ebony fingerboard machine 
tuners 

1

7 Intermediate  Instrument
Giuseppe SBCEK500C or 
equal

4/4 Cello Outfit carved wood 
ebony fingerboard

1

8 Protec C310E or equal 4/4 Cello Bag 8

9 Protec C309E or equal 3/4 Cello Bag 4

10 Professional Grade
Giuseppe LE38MM or 
equal

3/4 Cello Modestly flamed 
traditional finished with hand 
applied spirit varnish Aged tone 
woods 
* Includes soft case and CODA 
PRODIGY 3/4 BOW

2

11 CodaBow Prodigy or Equal 3/4 Cello Bow 2

12 CodaBow Revalation or equal French Bass Bow  3

Award Totals: $21,175.07

Vendor Part 
No. Unit Price Extended Price Offering Alternate Offer Description

Vendor Part 
No. Unit Price

Extended 
Price Offering Alternate Offer Description

SH500C44 $ 1,298.95 $1,298.95 Alternate Offer

Franz Hoffmann® Concert Cello Outfit 

C430 $ 1,243.00 $1,243.00 As specified

DNC4 $ 327.00 $981.00 As specified O4CW $ 120.00 $360.00 Alternate Offer
Krutz Pernambuco Wrapped Carbon Cello 
Bow

CBM6BLK44 $ 1,396.96 $6,984.80 Alternate Offer
Bam Newtech Mobile Cello Case - WITH 
Wheels

E440 $ 382.00 $1,910.00 Alternate Offer
Krutz Ultralight 9lb faux carbon fiber.  2 
bow holders and includes backpack straps.

HBB42012 $ 72.73 $72.73 Alternate Offer Heritage® Bass Bag 5mm Foam P320 $ 221.00 $221.00 Alternate Offer Krutz Ultra heavy padded black nylon bag.  
Reinforced seams and handles.

LC1144 $ 2,262,588.15 $4,525,176.30 Alternate Offer

Carlo Lamberti® Sonata Cello Top: Spruce
Back & Ribs: Maple
Neck: Maple
Fingerboard: Ebony
Fittings: Ebony
Strings: Thomastik-Infeld Spirocore 
Tungsten C & G and Larsen Soloist D & A

B440 $ 1,965.00 $3,930.00 Alternate Offer

Krutz 400 Series Cello - Highly flamed with 
little to no antiquing. Outfit includes 
Heavy padded gig bag case and carbon 
fiber bow.

LB11 $ 2,652.05 $2,652.05 Alternate Offer Carlo Lamberti® Sonata Bass 3/4 B320 $ 1,670.00 $1,670.00 Alternate Offer

Krutz 200 Series 3/4 Bass Outfit - Hybrid 
bass gamba corners fully carved top 
laminate back and sides. Outfit includes 
heavy padded bag and carbon bow.

LC11 $ 2,261.15 $2,261.15 Alternate Offer

Carlo Lamberti® Sonata Cello 4/4Made by 
hand entirely from solid aged spruce and 
maple tonewood enabling a powerful and 
open tone ready to explore a wider range 
of expression. Violin-shaped bouts; full-
plate machine pegs. Spirit varnish is 
delicately shaded and rubbed out to a 

C420 $ 932.00 $932.00 Alternate Offer

Krutz 200 Series 4/4 Cello Outfit - Fully 
hand-carved with moderately flamed back 
and ribs. Outfit includes heavy padded bag 
and carbon bow.

HCB32044 $ 33.82 $270.56 Alternate Offer Heritage Cello Bag 5 mm Foam E410 $ 82.00 $656.00 Alternate Offer
Krutz Traditional heavy padded 4/4 Cello 
Bag

HCB32034 $ 33.82 $135.28 Alternate Offer Heritage Cello Bag 5 mm Foam E310 $ 82.00 $328.00 Alternate Offer Krutz Traditional heavy padded 3/4 Cello 
Bag

LC11 $ 2,588.15 $5,176.30 Alternate Offer

Carlo Lamberti® Sonata Cello 3/4Made by 
hand entirely from solid aged spruce and 
maple tonewood enabling a powerful and 
open tone ready to explore a wider range 
of expression. Violin-shaped bouts; full-
plate machine pegs. Spirit varnish is 
delicately shaded and rubbed out to a 
medium gloss bringing out the beautiful 
wood grain. Fitted with professional level 
Thomastik Infeld Belcanto strings and 

No Bid

SPC3 $ 496.36 $992.72 As specified O3BC $ 72.00 $144.00 Alternate Offer Krutz Braided carbon Cello bow

BRF3 $ 453.00 $1,359.00 As specified R/G3BC $ 133.00 $399.00 Alternate Offer Krutz French Braided Carbon Bass Bow

$9,803.37 $11,793.00

Shar Music Boothe Music LLC
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateAdam Lundine
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator Date

26-064 Creative Cloud
The purpose: This is the annual renewal of Adobe Creative Cloud software used in various instructional
labs and student/staff devices.

Kent Corser
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator Date

26-061 F5 equipment
The purpose:

Kent Corser
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator Date

26-060 KnowBe4 Security Awareness
The purpose: This 3-year software purchase will continue the BV Security Awareness program
for the district employees.

Brian Daley
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator Date

26-062 MS Pre-engineering Devices
Purpose: This purchase will refresh the current Middle School Pre-engineering lab devices.

Kent Corser
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP 

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________ 

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time): 

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator Date

This purchase is to provide labor and materials as needed to replace the compressor #2 in Chiller #2 at Cedar Hills 
Elementary.

Jake Slodobnik
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PROJECT PROPOSAL 
 

Company Proposal Date: 1/26/2026
Helm Service Proposal Number: P18992
7957 Bond St. 
Lenexa, KS 66214 
Ph: 913-205-8858 

 

Bill To Identity Agreement Location 
Blue Valley School District 
15020 Metcalf Ave 
Overland Park, KS 66223 
Lawrence Saxton 

Cedar Hills Elementary School 
9100 West 165th Street 
Overland Park, KS 66085 
Lawrence Saxton 

RE: Cedar Hills Elementary School - Chiller #2 Compressor #2 Replacement Quote [TIPS Comprehensive HVAC 
Cooperative Procurement Contract #25010502] 
  
Lawrence, 
  
Helm Service would like to thank you for the opportunity to provide this proposal for your 
consideration.   Partnering with Helm Service for this work will ensure you are receiving the highest technical 
expertise in our industry.   Our mechanical service procedures promote the highest safety and environmentally 
conscious practices available. 
  
Scope: 
Provide labor and materials as needed to replace the compressor #2 in Chiller #2. Included ae the following:

 Evacuate circuit #2 of refrigerant and dispose properly as per EPA guidelines. 
 (1) Remanufactured 70-ton Rotary Screw Compressor with (1) year warranty on compressor. 
 30-ton Crane Rental to remove old and reinstall new. 
 (2) New Drier Cores. 
 . 
 (1) New 150-amp contactor. 
 Reuse Existing oil and crankcase heaters. 
 Pressurize circuit with nitrogen to perform leak test and pull vacuum to hold at 500 microns. 
 Labor to charge Circuit with new R407 refrigerant-Refrigerant provided by owner. 
 Startup and operational checks. 
 Jobsite cleanup and trash disposal. 
 Haul off old compressor to our shop. Crate and prep old compressor to ship off to MFR in Dallas, TX. 
 Shipping costs to and from vendor. 

Price for Above (2-3-Week Lead Time)                                                     $32,429.00 

Alternates: 

New OEM Compressor (2-3-Week Lead Time)                                       $60,694.00 
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TIPS-USA Procurement Notes: 

Once ready to purchase, please Issue a purchase order made payable to Vendor (Helm) and reference the TIPS 
Contract number #25010502 on the PO.  Send both the PO and this proposal directly to tipspo@tips-usa.com. The 
Proposal/PO will be verified for compliance by TIPS and forwarded to HELM.  You, the member, will receive a letter 
of compliance for your files. 
  
  
Clarifications: 

 Tariff Alert: The prices quoted herein are based on the current tariff rates, duties, government charges, and 
trade regulations as of the date of this quote. If any new tariffs, duties, taxes, or similar charges are 
imposed, or any existing tariffs, duties, or charges are increased or modified by any government or 
regulatory authority (collectively, "Tariff Changes"), and such Tariff Changes result in an increase in the cost 
of goods, Helm Service reserves the right to adjust the pricing of the affected goods to reflect the increased 
costs. Helm Service is not obligated to deliver the goods and/or services until an agreement on the new 
price has been reached.  Upon customer approval, Helm will verify with suppliers if any price increases have 
occurred and if so, will notify customer to review required price adjustment prior to order. 

 Helm Service is not responsible for delays in equipment/material deliveries due to supply chain 
issues.  With current environment, pricing is subject to change pending any equipment cost increases.  

 Due to new A2L refrigerant regulations, 410-A Equipment will be discontinued after the first of the year. 
 Work to be performed during normal working hours of 7:00am thru 3:30pm, Monday thru Friday.
 Helm Shall properly dispose of all debris created by the above noted repairs. 
 If additional problems are found, another proposal will be offered to address anything additional. 
 

it is to be utilized for the agreement evaluation. This Agreement sets forth all of the terms and conditions 
binding upon the parties hereto; and no person has authority to make any claim, representation, promise 
or condition on behalf of Helm Service, which is not expressed herein. No party shall alter this 
agreement.  This proposal will become a binding Agreement only after acceptance by Client and approval 
by an officer of Helm Service as evidenced by their signatures below.  All rights to any designs presented are 
retained by Helm Service. 

Exclusions: 

 The scope of this proposal does not include the replacement of any other components of the mechanical or 
controls systems that are not specifically listed in this proposal. 

 Temporary HVAC equipment or rental equipment. 
 Applicable Tax 
 Permits, Inspection fees of any kind. 
 Isolation valves, strainers, check valves, etc. unless specifically noted. 
 

above. 
 Roofing, cutting, patching, flashing, painting. 
 Structural building/walls; cutting, patching, and coring. 
 All work associated with Fire/Life Safety, including interfaces and interlocks to the Fire Alarm System, 

smoke detectors, fire dampers, smoke control dampers, and smoke/fire dampers. 
 Additional ventilation requirements/revisions that may be required due to A2L refrigerants. 
 Utility Services: We assume the existing utilities (gas, electrical, water) serving the facility are properly sized 

to handle the current building loads.  If it is determined service upgrades are necessary to facilitate current 
or future loads, additional costs may apply through your utility provider and/or Helm. 
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 Payment and performance bonds. 
 All responsibility for Lead and asbestos identification, abatement, removal, and disposal prior to start of 

job. 

  
 
Thank you for the opportunity.   We look forward to working with you. 
  
Ann Liggett   
Account Executive |Helm Service   
913-205-8858 cell   
aliggett@helmgroup.com   
  

  

  
Upon execution as provided below, this agreement, including the following pages attached hereto (collectively, the 

of this Agreement, acknowledges that it has reviewed and understands the attached terms and conditions and has the 
authority to enter into this Agreement. 

Contractor 
 Customer 

  
Signature (Authorized Representative) 

Ann Liggett 

 Signature (Authorized Representative) 
 

Name (Print/ Type) 

913-205-8858 

 Name (Print/ Type) 
 

Phone  Title 

1/30/2026 P18992   

Date Proposal #   Date PO#
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HELM SERVICE 
PROJECT - TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. TERMS: IF THIS CONTRACT INVOLVES THE PURCHASE OF MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT ONLY, THE PURCHASE PRICE SHALL BE PAYABLE AT THE TIME OF 
DELIVERY OF THE MATERIALS AND/OR EQUIPMENT; IF THIS CONTRACT INVOLVES LABOR OR LABOR AND MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT, PROGRESS 
BILLINGS WILL BE SUBMITTED COVERING MATERIALS AND EQUIPMENT DELIVERED TO THE JOB SITE OR STORED IN ACCEPTABLE STORAGE FOR DELIVERY 
TO THE JOB SITE. THIS PROGRESS BILLING WILL ALSO INCLUDE LABOR WHICH HAS BEEN EXPENDED ON THE JOB OR DIRECTLY CONCERNED WITH THE JOB. 
THIS PROGRESS BILLING AMOUNT WILL BE DUE TEN DAYS AFTER BILLING DATE. FOR JOBS WHICH REQUIRE RETENTION, A RETENTION AMOUNT OF FIVE 
PERCENT WILL BE WITHHELD. IT WILL BECOME DUE AND PAYABLE AT THE COMPLETION OF HELM SERVICE'S PORTION OF THE PROJECT. 

2. Title to the materials and equipment shall remain with Helm Service until the customer has paid the total price in full, and if the customer should fail to 
make any payment to Helm Service as the same becomes due or the customer fails to perform any other obligation under this contract, Helm Service may 
take possession of the materials and equipment. 

3. Helm Service warrants that its labor and installation shall be done in a good and workmanlike manner and shall be free from defects for a period of one 
year after completion of the installation. Helm Service warrants that all equipment and materials furnished will be new unless otherwise specified in this 
contract, and that Helm Service has good title thereto. Helm Service does not warrant the quality of the equipment and materials furnished in any respect 
and the customer's remedy for defects in the equipment and materials shall be against Helm Service's suppliers or the manufacturers of the materials and 
equipment. Helm Service will deliver all manufacturers' written warranties to the customer upon completion of installation. UNDER NO CIRCUMSTANCES 
WILL HELM SERVICE BE RESPONSIBLE FOR LOSS OF USE, LOSS OF PROFITS, INCREASED OPERATING OR MAINTENANCE EXPENSE, CLAIMS OF CUSTOMER'S, 
TENANTS, OR CLIENTS, OR ANY SPECIAL, INDIRECT OR CONSEQUENTIAL DAMAGES. 

4. Once the equipment and materials have been delivered to the job site, the Customer assumes all risk of damage to same, by any cause, except that 
brought about by the negligence of Helm Service and its employees. The customer shall carry all Risk, Property Insurance to the full value of the materials 
and equipment and name Helm Service as an Additional Insured to the extent of its interest. 
The Customer shall be responsible for purchasing and maintaining such liability insurance as will protect him against claims which may arise from 
operations under the Contract.  

5. Helm Service will obtain Liability and Workers' Compensation Insurance protecting it against claims which may arise from operations under the 
contract. 

6. Helm Service will make delivery or installation, when provided herein, within a reasonable time after this contract is entered into, but it will not be 
responsible for delays caused by unavailability of machinery, equipment, materials or parts, shipper's delays, strikes, lockouts, restrictions imposed by civil 
or military authority, priority regulation of some governmental body, insurrection or riot, or any other cause beyond Helm Service's control. If a time for 
performance is stated in this agreement, it shall be deemed to be an estimate only.  If Helm Service is required to make some installation under this 
contract, the customer shall be responsible for putting the premises in a satisfactory condition including furnishing electric power, light, heat, and water 
so that installation can start promptly and be completed efficiently. 

7. If Helm Service shall fail to perform any of its obligations under this contract and fails to perform after the customer gives Helm Service ten (10) days' 
written notice of the specific deficiencies, the customer may have someone else complete the performance, but Helm Service's liability shall be limited to 
what it reasonably costs the customer to obtain completion of Helm Service's obligations under this contract. If Helm Service fails to perform any of its 
obligations under this contract, the customer, at customer's option, and without being required to do so, may cancel this contract by giving Helm Service 
ten (10) days written notice. 

8. If the Project is stopped for a period of thirty (30) days under an order of any court or other public authority having jurisdiction, or as a result of an act 
of government, such as a declaration of a national emergency making materials unavailable, through no act or fault of Helm Service or if the Project 
should be stopped for a period of thirty (30) days by Helm Service for the customer's failure to make payment thereon as provided in Paragraph 1, then 
Helm Service may upon seven (7) days written notice to the customer terminate this agreement and immediately recover from the customer payment for 
all work to date and for any proven loss sustained upon any materials, equipment, tools, construction equipment and machinery, including reasonable 
profit and damages. 

9. In the event either party must commence a legal action to enforce any rights under this contract, the successful party shall be entitled to all court costs 
and reasonable attorney's fees as determined by the court for prosecuting or defending the claim as the case might be. 

10. The Customer shall not leave any of the equipment or systems furnished or installed by Helm Service in operation until the customer has approved and 
accepted same and paid Helm Service the price in full. 

11. Any written notice required under this contract may be delivered personally to the other party or mailed as certified mail, return receipt requested, to 
the other party's address as it appears in this agreement or as given to the other party by written notice during the terms of this contract. 

12. To the fullest extent permitted by law, Customer shall indemnify and hold harmless Helm Service, its agents and employees from and against all 
ng from the performance of work hereunder, 

provided that such claim, damage, loss or expense is caused in whole or in part by any active or passive act or omission of Customer, anyone directly or 
indirectly employed by Customer, or anyone for whose acts Customer may be liable, regardless of whether it is caused in part by the negligence of Helm 
Service. 
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateJake Slobodnik 
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TIPS Cooperative Purchasing Contract Number:

THIS PROPOSAL IS IN REGARDS TO THE TENNIS COURTS AT BLUE VALLEY 
NORTH HIGH SCHOOL. 

THE PURPOSE OF THIS WORK IS TO REMOVE THE EXISTING FABRIC SYSTEM, 
CRACK FILL ALL CRACKS, AND RESURFACE THE TENNIS COURTS.

PROPOSAL SCOPE:

44



   SY

$61,874.00TOTAL COST OF PROPOSAL
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateMatt Ortman
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Quote/Order 
2026 - 2027    Unified School District No. 229, Johnson City, State of Kansas    Drafted: 02/18/2026 

1
 

AVID Center 
Products and Services Quote/Order 
Quote/Order #: Q-92781   AVID Center Representative: Julie Osvath 
Client: Unified School District No. 229, Johnson 
City, State of Kansas 
Address: 15020 Metcalf Ave 
Overland Park, KS 66223 

 Phone: (858) 654-5115 
Email: josvath@avid.org 

     
Effective Date: July 01, 2026  Expiration Date: June 30, 2027  
    

 
 

    
Blue Valley High School    

QTY PRODUCT NAME UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE 
1 AVID Membership Fees Secondary $4,725.00 $4,725.00 
1 AVID Weekly Secondary $735.00 $735.00 

Blue Valley High School SUBTOTAL: $5,460.00 

 

    
Blue Valley North High School    

QTY PRODUCT NAME UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE 
1 AVID Membership Fees Secondary $4,725.00 $4,725.00 
1 AVID Weekly Secondary $735.00 $735.00 

Blue Valley North High School SUBTOTAL: $5,460.00 

 

    
Blue Valley Northwest High School    

QTY PRODUCT NAME UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE 
1 AVID Membership Fees Secondary $4,725.00 $4,725.00 
1 AVID Weekly Secondary $735.00 $735.00 

Blue Valley Northwest High School SUBTOTAL: $5,460.00 

 

    
Blue Valley Southwest High School    

QTY PRODUCT NAME UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE 
1 AVID Membership Fees Secondary $4,725.00 $4,725.00 
1 AVID Weekly Secondary $735.00 $735.00 

Blue Valley Southwest High School SUBTOTAL: $5,460.00 
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Quote/Order 
2026 - 2027    Unified School District No. 229, Johnson City, State of Kansas    Drafted: 02/18/2026 

2
 

 

    
Blue Valley West High School    

QTY PRODUCT NAME UNIT PRICE EXTENDED PRICE 
1 AVID Membership Fees Secondary $4,725.00 $4,725.00 
1 AVID Weekly Secondary $735.00 $735.00 

Blue Valley West High School SUBTOTAL: $5,460.00 

 

TOTAL: $27,300.00 

 
plus all applicable taxes 

 

 Additional Comments: 

N/A 
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Quote/Order 
2026 - 2027    Unified School District No. 229, Johnson City, State of Kansas    Drafted: 02/18/2026 

3
 

This AVID Center Products and Services Quote/Order is a Subsequent Quote/Order as defined in the General Terms and 
Conditions previously agreed to by AVID Center  . This Quote/Order and any exhibits or 
attachments hereto, together with the Ts&Cs (including the definitions of terms set forth at https://www.avid.org/Page/3290 or 

, supersedes all previous Quote/Orders and constitutes a 
binding agreement between AVID Center and Client with respect to the AVID Products and Services specified above. Certain AVID 

https://www.avid.org/rest-
assured-policy. 

AVID Center is committed to assisting Client with a successful implementation. Additional information regarding professional 
learning registrations is listed below: 

 Newly implementing AVID sites are best supported by a core site team of educators  at least 8 for AVID Secondary or 4 
for AVID Elementary. In the initial year of implementation, Client agrees to enroll participants into AVID Summer Institute 

to the minimum core site team described herein, unless AVID Center agrees otherwise on this Quote/Order. 
If other professional learning events are taken instead of SI, prices will be adjusted accordingly upon completion of the 
training event.  

 For each existing site in year 2 and beyond of AVID implementation, Client agrees to enroll one (1) participant into AVID 
Ignite, unless Client notifies otherwise. If a participant is not enrolled or a registrant does not attend, Client will receive 
a voucher to be used for AVID Ignite in the following summer after payment has been received. 

Client will be invoiced for the greater of the number of participants from a site registered for the event or committed to on this 
Quote/Order. No payment is due at the time of execution of this Quote/Order, notwithstanding anything to the contrary in the 
General Terms and Conditions. At the time of invoicing, AVID Center will verify registration fees for each site listed on this 
Quote/Order and any registrations which have been previously paid will be removed from the invoice. Payment will be due within 

 Each party has caused this Quote/Order to 
be signed by its duly authorized representative. The terms of this Quote/Order will control in the event of a conflict with any terms 
or conditions set forth in any purchase order or other document or communication from Client and any such terms and conditions 
are hereby rejected by AVID Center and of no effect. 

 

AVID Center, 
a California Non-Profit Corporation 501(c)(3) 
 

Unified School District No. 229, Johnson City, State 
of Kansas 

Sign:   \SignHere2\ Sign:  \SignHere1\ 

Print 
Name: \InternalName2\ 

Print 
Name: \PrintedName1\ 

Title: \InternalTitle2\ Title: \TitleHere1\ 

Date: \Date2\ Date: \Date1\ 

Email: contracts@avid.org Email: /Email1/ 

 

 
AVID Center 
5187 College Ave., Ste. 163 
San Diego, CA 92115 
Employer ID # 33-0522594 
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Quote/Order 
2026 - 2027    Unified School District No. 229, Johnson City, State of Kansas    Drafted: 02/18/2026 

4
 

Sign:    Sign:   

Print 
Name:  

Print 
Name: 

 

 

Title: 
 

Title:
 

Date:  Date:  

Email:  Email:  
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateDr. Mark Schmidt
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateJake Slobodnik
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateKent Corser
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator DateDr. Mark Schmidt
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BLUE VALLEY SCHOOL DISTRICT #229
BOARD OF EDUCATION APPROVAL FORM

Department/Bldg.: Requested By:

Purpose: (please explain in detail why we need the items or services requested)

Fund: Account Number:

Funding Year: Location(s) items or services are for:

Does this use Bond Funds? (if yes, see below)

This request includes extended warranty, service or maintenance.
Please complete the Bond Warranty Agreement Form on page 2

This request includes training or consultation.
Please complete Bond Consultant Services Form on Page 3

Check all that apply to this Purchase:
This is a New Contract

This is a Renewal Contract

This is a Curriculum purchase

 This is a New Bid/RFP  

This is a Purchase from Bid  # ___________

This Purchase requires BOE Signatures 

This can be purchased off of Contract # ___________     

Begin Date: End Date:

Company: Street Address:

Contact Name: City: 

Telephone: State: 

Email: Zip Code:

Cost: 

Prior Year Cost: 

Terms: (Annual, Multi-Year, One-Time):  

Month:(board meeting) Budget Administrator Date
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	Apple HS-MS CTE Device Refresh 26-065
	Circadia BVNW SPED Improvements PUR & DOCS FL
	Universal Construction Foundationrepair PUR & DOCS FL
	Circadia OMS HMS Flooring PUR & DOCS FL
	EF Commercial Flooring PUR & DOCS FL
	Regents Flooring STAN OTE PUR & DOCS FL
	Spoonball Sports BVN Volleyball Standards PUR & DOCS FL
	26026 WSM Kitchen Supplies PUR & Docs FL
	26027 Copy Paper PUR & Doc FL
	26028 BVN Stove PUR & Docs FL
	26030 Orchestra Instruments PUR & Docs FL
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